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Fertilizer shall be applied to all disturbed areas and incorporated into the seedbed prior to seeding or placement of sod 
at the rate specified in Sections 250 and 252 of the Standard Specifications.  This work shall be included in the cost of 
EARTH EXCAVATION. 
 
The Contractor will be required to furnish 5 1/2" high brass stencils as approved by the Engineer and install stationing at 
250' intervals.  Stationing shall be placed on both lanes of 2-lane highways and on the outside lanes in both directions 
on 4-lane highways.  The stations shall be placed 6" inside the pavement marking edge so they can be read from the 
shoulder.  This work will be included in the cost of the final pavement surface. 
 
The soils report and profiles are available at the District Office for Contractor’s review. 
 
The cost of making storm sewer connections to existing drainage structures shall be included in the various contract unit 
prices for STORM SEWER. 
 
Lateral distances from the centerline on all inlets are to the face of the inlet. 
 
The Contractor shall be responsible for collecting and maintaining an electronic log of all stakeout survey that is 
performed on the job, either by him/her or any sub-contractor performing the stakeout.  Upon request, all logs shall be 
submitted to the Department.  No additional compensation will be allowed for this work, but shall be considered included 
in the cost for CONSTRUCTION LAYOUT. 
 
Pavement Marking shall be done according to Standard 780001, except as follows: 
 
 1. All words, such as ONLY, shall be 8 feet high. 
 2. All non-freeway arrows shall be the large size. 
 3. The distance between yellow no-passing lines shall be 8 inches, not 7 inches, as shown in the detail of 

Typical Lane and Edge Lines. 
 4. Centerline Skip Dash Pavement Marking on multi-lane divided, multi-lane undivided, and one-way 

roadway shall be according to District Standard 41.1. 
 
PERMANENT SURVEY MARKERS, TYPE II, shall be set at intervals of 1 mile or as directed by the Engineer.  Bridge or 
culvert projects shall have one survey marker placed near the structure.  Estimated: 1 Each. 
 
Permanent Survey Markers, Type II placed in urban areas should be placed in sidewalk areas.  The marker shall be 
placed as shown on District Standard 66.2.  The sidewalk shall be placed around the marker and flush with the top. 
 
Permanent Survey Markers, Type II shall be cast-in-place as shown on District Standard 66.2, or another option would 
be to install a vaulted style, monumented as described by NGS as a 3D monument (Top Security Sleeve Rod 
Monument), with installation instructions provided by the District Chief of Surveys.  If poured in place, the bottom of the 
marker shall be 5’-0” below the ground surface. 
 
The Contractor shall submit to the Engineer a description of location, elevation, and coordinates for each permanent 
survey marker.  The horizontal coordinates must be derived by GPS and the elevation derived using an electronic level.  
The meta data, such as the Geoid used, (NGS adjustment ie: 97 HARN, 03, 07), and the base point(s) name or number 
shall be submitted along with a complete collection log.  If collected using RTK method, it will require either 3 collections 
(averaged) from 2 different bases, or a minimum of 3 collections (averaged), at least 2 hours apart, from the same base.  
If using a CORS type network, the collection procedure shall include localizing with check shots on at least 2 different 
HARN monuments both before and after collection.  The level circuit shall be run from furnished mark to furnished mark 
and then adjusted.  The error of closure shall be submitted with the electronic level notes in a recognized format 
approved by the Engineer and/or the Chief of Surveys.  The Engineer shall submit this information to the District Chief of 
Surveys. 
 
 

The Contractor shall be responsible for locating and protecting utility property during construction operations as outlined 
in Article 107.39 of the Standard Specifications.  The following listed utilities located within the project limits or 
immediately adjacent to the project construction limits are members of JULIE: 
 
 Nicor Gas Co. 630/388-3046 
 IL American Water Co. 815/625-3196 
 Comcast Cable 224/229-5432 
 Windstream 414/313-9032 
 iFiber 815/753-5798 
 City of Sterling 815/632-6624 
 AT&T 630/573-5465 
 ComEd 630/437-2212 
 
IDOT is not a member of JULIE.  If you are near any overhead lighting, intersection lighting or traffic signals, contact the 
IDOT Traffic Office at 815/284-5469 at least 48 hours prior to work. 
 
It shall be the Contractor’s responsibility to contact the municipality to determine approved methods of utility structure 
adjustment.  Utility structures may include, but are not limited to, manholes, water valves, handholes, etc.  All materials 
and work necessary to complete adjustments per municipality requirements shall be considered included in the cost of 
the associated adjustment pay item. 
 
The Contractor must notify the Traffic Operations Engineer, Kristie Nyderek, at (815)284-5469 prior to proposed sign 
installation. 










































































































































































































